STATE AGENCY BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: September 9, 1998

Tract  Advertised No. Acres Bonus Accepted Accepted State
Number  Acreage Bid Bid Bidder Bid Royalty Acres Bonus Leases Parish
31354 4.600 No Bid Quachita
31355 226.623 1 226.623 | Goodrich Petroleum of LA, A Nevada Corp. 46,684.34 | 0.2100000 226.623 46,684.34 16274 Quachita
31356 20.000 1 20.000 | Goodrich Petroleum of LA, A Nevada Corp. 4,120.00| 0.2500000 20.000 4,120.00 16275 Quachita
31357 926.662 No Bid Beauregard/Vernon
31358 557.125 No Bid Lafayette/Vermilion
31359 41.000 1 41.000 | Newfield Exploration Co. 123,123.00| 0.2500000 41.000 123,123.00 16276 Lafayette
31359 2 12.500 | Newfield Exploration Co. 112,537.50| 0.2500000 Lafayette
31360 177.000 1 49.100 | Newfield Exploration Co. 442,047.30| 0.2500000 Lafayette
31360 2 177.000 | Newfield Exploration Co. 531,531.00| 0.2500000 177.000 531,531.00 16277 Lafayette
31361 475.170 No Bid Terrebonne
Totals 2,428.180 526.223 $1,260,043.14 464.623 $705,458.34




