
INLAND BID TRACT SHEET DATE:   September 9, 1998

Tract Advertised  No. Acres Bonus Accepted Accepted State
Number Acreage  Bid Bid Bidder Bid Royalty Acres Bonus Leases Parish

31316 160.000 No Bid  Natchitoches
31317 24.000 1 24.000 Marlin Exploration, Inc. 2,400.00 0.1666667 24.000 2,400.00 16263 1 Natchitoches
31318 87.000 1 87.000 Marlin Exploration, Inc. 8,700.00 0.1666667 87.000 8,700.00 16264 1 Natchitoches/Winn

31319 55.000 No Bid  Natchitoches
31320 80.000 1 80.000 El Toro Production Co., Inc. 3,200.00 0.1875000 80.000 3,200.00 16265 1 Concordia
31321 40.000 1 40.000 Chesapeake Operating, Inc. 14,240.00 0.2500000 40.000 14,240.00 16266 1 Vernon
31321 2 40.000 Union Pacific Resources Co. 14,080.00 0.2000000  Vernon
31322 14.000 No Bid  Allen
31323 584.000 1 123.480 Brechtel Energy Corp. 27,412.56 0.2150000 123.480 27,412.56 16267 1 Cameron
31324 12.000 1 12.000 Rebel Mineral, Inc. 3,612.00 0.2200000 12.000 3,612.00 16268 1 Lafayette
31324 2 12.000 LA Oil & Gas, Inc. 3,000.00 0.2250000  Lafayette
31325 349.690 No Bid  Vernilion
31326 1,094.680 No Bid  Vernilion
31327 92.000 1 92.000 TDC Energy Corp. 50,692.00 0.2300000 92.000 50,692.00 16269 1 St. Charles
31328 1,595.000 1 87.000 Elizabeth S. Baudin 22,551.27 0.2250000 REJECTED  Jefferson/Lafourche

31329 15.530 No Bid  Jefferson
31330 335.000 No Bid  Jefferson
31331 116.000 No Bid  St. Bernard
31332 10.000 No Bid  St. Bernard
31333 87.000 No Bid  St. Bernard
31334 93.000 No Bid  St. Bernard
31335 45.000 No Bid  St. Bernard
31336 25.000 No Bid  St. Bernard
31337 166.320 No Bid  Plaquemines/St. Bernard

31338 1,644.370 No Bid  Plaquemines/St. Bernard

31339 2,270.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31340 1,680.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31341 2,497.270 No Bid  St. Bernard
31342 2,497.270 No Bid  St. Bernard
31343 2,497.270 No Bid  St. Bernard
31344 2,313.820 1 201.430 Stephen M. Jenkins & Assoc., Inc. 45,724.61 0.2150000 201.430 45,724.61 16270 1 St. Bernard
31345 925.920 No Bid  St. Bernard
31346 1,710.310 No Bid  Plaquemines/St. Bernard
31347 915.610 No Bid  Plaquemines/St. Bernard

31348 969.620 No Bid  Plaquemines/St. Bernard



INLAND BID TRACT SHEET DATE:   September 9, 1998

Tract Advertised  No. Acres Bonus Accepted Accepted State
Number Acreage  Bid Bid Bidder Bid Royalty Acres Bonus Leases Parish

31349 1,142.810 No Bid  Plaquemines/St. Bernard
31350 226.270 1 34.220 Stephen M. Jenkins & Assoc., Inc. 7,767.94 0.2150000 34.220 7,767.94 16271 1 Plaquemines/St. Bernard

31351 1,901.250 1 133.550 Stephen M. Jenkins & Assoc., Inc. 27,644.85 0.2150000 133.550 27,644.85 16272 1 Plaquemines
31352 634.820 1 326.860 Stephen M. Jenkins & Assoc., Inc. 67,660.02 0.2150000 326.860 67,660.02 16273 1 Plaquemines
31353 494.740 No Bid  St. Bernard

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Totals 29,401.570 1,293.540          $298,685.25 1,154.540 $259,053.98 11


