OFFSHORE BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: December 9, 1998

Tract Advertised  No. Acres Bonus Accepted Accepted State

Number Acreage Bid Bid Bidder Bid Royalty Acres Bonus Leases Parish
31474 746.000 1 301.310 | Cockrell Oil & Gas Co. 38,118.73 0.2100000 301.310 38,118.73 16328 St. Mary
31475 666.970 No Bid St. Mary
31476 24.400 1 24.400 | Mark A. O'Neil & Assoc., Inc. 7,442.00 0.2100000 24.400 7,442.00 16329 Terrebonne
31477 227.850 1 192.730 | BH Petroleum, Inc. 26,404.01 0.2100000 | REJECTED Plaquemines
31478 2,292.300 1 457.730 | BH Petroleum, Inc. 62,709.01 0.2100000 | REJECTED Plaquemines
31479 674.370 BH Petroleum, Inc. Plaguemines
31480 476.790 No Bid Plaguemines
31481 2,414.310 No Bid Plaquemines
31482 2,497.270 No Bid Plaguemines
Totals 10,020.260 976.170 $134,673.75 325.710 $45,560.73




