
INLAND BID TRACT SHEET DATE:  September 8, 1999

Tract Advertised  No. Acres Bonus Accepted Accepted State
Number Acreage  Bid Bid Bidder Bid Royalty Acres Bonus Leases Parish

32014 145.000 1 145.000 Marshland Production Co. 14,645.00 0.2050000  Bossier/Caddo
32014 2 145.000 Cohort Energy Company 23,200.00 0.2450000 145.000 23,200.00 16530 1 Bossier/Caddo
32015 500.000 1 500.000 Cohort Energy Company 250,500.00 0.2450000 500.000 250,500.00 16531 1 Bossier/Webster
32015 2 500.000 Questar Explor. & Prod. Co. 62,500.00 0.1875000  Bossier/Webster
32016 10.000 1 10.000 Angelle Donohue Oil & Gas Prop 2,000.00 0.2250000 10.000 2,000.00 16532 1 Calcasieu
32017 21.000 1 21.000 Cash River Exploration, Inc. 4,725.00 0.2500000 21.000 4,725.00 16533 1 Calcasieu
32018 2,450.000 No Bid  Cameron
32019 1,833.000 No Bid  Cameron
32020 2,500.000 No Bid  Cameron
32021 352.000 No Bid  Cameron
32022 2,496.560 No Bid  Cameron
32023 41.000 No Bid  St. Martin
32024 56.000 No Bid  St. Martin
32025 73.000 No Bid  St. Martin
32026 1,042.000 1 601.000 Pinnacle Resources, Inc. 64,006.50 0.2150000 601.000 64,006.50 16534 1 St. Martin
32027 281.000 1 281.000 Pinnacle Resources, Inc. 29,926.50 0.2150000 281.000 29,926.50 16535 1 St. Martin
32028 48.000 1 48.000 Pinnacle Resources, Inc. 9,684.96 0.2150000 48.000 9,684.96 16536 1 St. Martin
32029 12.000 1 12.000 Pinnacle Resources, Inc. 2,421.24 0.2150000 12.000 2,421.24 16537 1 St. Martin
32030 82.000 1 82.000 Pinnacle Resources, Inc. 16,545.14 0.2150000 82.000 16,545.14 16538 1 St. Martin
32031 56.080 No Bid  St. Martin
32032 36.000 No Bid  St. Martin
32033 25.810 No Bid  Iberville
32034 2,500.000 1 494.550 Vastar Resources, Inc. 63,188.65 0.2000000 REJECTED  St. Martin/St. Mary
32035 2,500.000 1 145.450 Vastar Resources, Inc. 18,584.15 0.2000000 REJECTED  Assumption/St. Martin/St. Mary

32035 2 72.000 Vastar Resources, Inc. 14,959.44 0.2000000 72.000 14,959.44 16539 1 Assumption/St. Martin/St. Mary

32036 166.000 No Bid  Assumption/St. Mary
32037 1,259.000 No Bid  St. Mary
32038 1,735.000 No Bid  St. Mary
32039 28.000 No Bid  Terrebonne
32040 390.000 1 85.000 Stone Energy Corporation 21,675.00 0.2150000 85.000 21,675.00 16540 1 Plaquemines
32040 2 36.000 Stone Energy Corporation 9,180.00 0.2150000 36.000 9,180.00 16541 1 Plaquemines
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32041 80.000 Withdrawn  Plaquemines
32042 52.000 Withdrawn  Plaquemines
32043 33.000 Withdrawn  Plaquemines
32044 32.950 Withdrawn  Plaquemines
32045 1,988.200 No Bid  Plaquemines
32046 1,537.210 1 178.200 WLB Investments, Inc. 35,996.40 0.2050000 178.200 35,996.40 16542 1 Plaquemines
32047 2,231.120 No Bid  Plaquemines
32048 2,497.270 1 93.200 WLB Investments, Inc. 16,496.40 0.2050000 93.200 16,496.40 16543 1 Plaquemines
32048 2 572.430 WLB Investments, Inc. 78,136.70 0.2050000 572.430 78,136.70 16544 1 Plaquemines
32049 2,175.870 1 507.490 WLB Investments, Inc. 69,272.39 0.2050000 507.490 69,272.39 16545 1 Plaquemines
32050 1,369.160 No Bid  Plaquemines
32051 1,389.000 1 160.660 WLB Investments, Inc. 75,670.86 0.2100000 160.660 75,670.86 16546 1 Plaquemines

 
 
 

Totals 34,024.230 4,689.980          $883,314.33 3,404.980 $724,396.53 17


