
INLAND BID TRACT SHEET DATE:   November 10, 1998

Tract Advertised  No. Acres Bonus Accepted Accepted State
Number Acreage  Bid Bid Bidder Bid Royalty Acres Bonus Leases Parish

31418 26.000 1 26.000 Cohort Energy Company 5,980.00 0.2000000 26.000 5,980.00 16305 1 Bossier
31419 10.170 1 10.170 Four Rivers Exploration, Inc. 635.63 0.1666667 10.170 635.63 16306 1 Catahoula
31420 34.000 1 34.000 Mark A. O’Neal & Assoc., Inc. 2,550.00 0.2500000 34.000 2,550.00 16307 1 Calcasieu
31421 97.000 1 96.330 Saltex Exploration, Inc. 24,082.50 0.2500000 96.330 24,082.50 16308 1 Calcasieu
31422 37.000 No Bid  Acadia/Vermilion
31423 12.000 1 12.000 Louisiana Land Mgmt, Inc. 4,380.00 0.2000000 12.000 4,380.00 16309 1 Acadia/Vermilion
31424 3.390 1 3.390 Richland Investments LLC 1,200.00 0.2260000  St. Mary
31424 2 3.390 Camplaq Land & Production Inc. 1,700.00 0.2200000  St. Mary
31424 3 3.390 Hunt Oil/Preston Expl/N Cntrl Oil 6,803.73 0.2200000 3.390 6,803.73 16310 1 St. Mary
31425 1,304.000 1 131.310 AD Ventures, Inc. 33,025.78 0.2150000 131.310 33,025.78 16311 1 St. Martin/St. Mary
31425 2 89.530 AD Ventures, Inc. 22,517.69 0.2150000 89.530 22,517.69 16312 1 St. Martin/St. Mary
31426 1,635.000 1 297.400 AD Ventures, Inc. 74,799.07 0.2150000 297.400 74,799.07 16313 1 St. Martin/St. Mary
31426 2 131.790 AD Ventures, Inc. 33,146.50 0.2150000 131.790 33,146.50 16314 1 St. Martin/St. Mary
31427 7.000 Withdrawn  Terrebonne
31428 870.000 1 298.860 Texaco E & P, Inc. 63,358.30 0.2250000 298.860 63,358.30 16315 1 Jefferson/Plaquemines

31429 309.000 1 120.000 Texaco E & P, Inc. 33,360.00 0.2250000 120.000 33,360.00 16316 1 Jefferson
31430 483.000 1 240.870 Marshland Production Co. 63,830.55 0.2250000 240.870 63,830.55 16317 1 Jefferson/Lafourche
31431 1,212.000 No Bid  Jefferson
31432 901.000 1 579.300 LL&E/Ocean Energy Inc. 174,948.60 0.2250000 579.300 174,948.60 16318 1 Jefferson
31433 298.000 1 148.880 LL&E/Ocean Energy Inc. 44,961.76 0.2250000 148.880 44,961.76 16319 1 Jefferson
31434 1,249.000 1 422.730 LL&E/Ocean Energy Inc. 127,664.46 0.2250000 422.730 127,664.46 16320 1 Jefferson
31435 2,087.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31436 1,215.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31437 696.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31438 1,665.000 1 365.840 Dimension Energy Co. LLC 75,000.00 0.2250000 365.840 75,000.00 16321 1 Plaquemines
31439 1,039.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31440 1,625.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31441 1,199.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31442 1,620.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31443 1,810.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31444 1,010.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31445 1,625.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31446 1,457.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31447 2,474.000 No Bid  St. Bernard
31448 1,834.000 No Bid  St. Bernard
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31449 650.000 No Bid  Plaquemines/St. Bernard
31450 71.000 No Bid  Plaquemines/St. Bernard

31451 269.000 No Bid  St. Bernard
31452 1,605.300 1 261.710 BH Petroleum, Inc. 40,565.05 0.2100000  St. Bernard
31452 2 37.180 Harold J. Anderson, Inc. 22,555.62 0.2200000 37.180 22,555.62 16322 1 St. Bernard
31453 1,454.000 1 438.430 BH Petroleum, Inc. 76,725.25 0.2100000  Plaquemines/St. Bernard
31453 2 270.000 Harold J. Anderson, Inc. 419,998.50 0.2200000 270.000 419,998.50 16323 1 Plaquemines/St. Bernard

31454 807.000 No Bid  Plaquemines/St. Bernard

31455 1,234.000 No Bid  Plaquemines/St. Bernard

31456 1,625.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31457 1,880.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31458 901.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31459 496.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31460 2,472.000 No Bid  Plaquemines
31461 2,497.270 1 49.590 Sunbelt Energy Limited 6,198.75 0.2100000 REJECTED  Plaquemines/St. Bernard

31462 804.210 1 33.290 Sunbelt Energy Limited 4,161.25 0.2100000 REJECTED  Plaquemines
31463 2,497.270 No Bid  Plaquemines
31464 1,670.340 No Bid  Plaquemines
31465 453.000 No Bid  St. Bernard
31466 1,963.000 1 374.060 BH Petroleum, Inc. 57,979.30 0.2100000  St. Bernard
31466 2 172.130 Harold J. Anderson, Inc. 104,424.38 0.2200000 172.130 104,424.38 16324 1 St. Bernard
31467 195.000 1 103.760 BH Petroleum, Inc. 16,082.80 0.2100000 103.760 16,082.80 16325 1 St. Bernard
31468 2,362.000 No Bid  Plaquemines/St. Bernard

31469 510.000 No Bid  St. Bernard
31470 580.470 No Bid  St. Bernard

 
 
 
 
 

Totals 56,840.420 4,755.330          $1,542,635.47 3,591.470 $1,354,105.87 21


