

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: December 9, 1998

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
31483	80.000	1	80.000	Herbert Cathey husband of Joan B. Cathey	4,000.00	0.2000000					Bossier/Caddo
31483		2	80.000	Dallas Exploration, Inc.	10,160.00	0.2000000	80.000	10,160.00	16330	1	Bossier/Caddo
31484	595.000			No Bid							Iberia
31485	2,160.000			No Bid							Iberia
31486	1,865.000			No Bid							Iberia
31487	2,393.940			No Bid							Iberia
31488	2,393.940			No Bid							Iberia
31489	1,891.560			No Bid							Iberia
31490	2,383.640	1	165.240	Woodland Petroleum Corp.	39,921.98	0.2100000	165.240	39,921.98	16331	1	Iberia
31491	2,356.000	1	663.740	Woodland Petroleum Corp.	159,589.65	0.2100000	663.740	159,589.65	16332	1	Iberia
31492	2,375.800			No Bid							Iberia/St. Mary
31493	2,446.000			No Bid							Iberia/St. Mary
31494	2,110.000			No Bid							St. Mary
31495	405.000			No Bid							St. Mary
31496	2,341.000			No Bid							Iberia
31497	2,386.000			No Bid							Iberia/St. Mary
31498	1,694.000			No Bid							St. Mary
31499	2,012.000			No Bid							St. Mary
31500	2,036.270			No Bid							St. Mary
31501	1,208.000			No Bid							St. Mary
31502	1,728.240			No Bid							St. Mary
31503	493.000			No Bid							Assumption
31504	385.670	1	385.670	Mineral Services, Inc.	88,704.10	0.2150000	385.670	88,704.10	16333	1	Assumption
31505	43.000	1	43.000	Phillips Petroleum Co.	13,960.38	0.2200000	43.000	13,960.38	16334	1	Assumption
31506	132.060	1	132.060	Phillips Petroleum Co.	40,489.60	0.2200000	132.060	40,489.60	16335	1	Assumption
31507	93.000			No Bid							Assumption
31508	207.000	1	207.000	BH Petroleum, Inc.	54,441.00	0.2250000	207.000	54,441.00	16336	1	Assumption
31509	425.850	1	82.640	Mineral Services, Inc.	19,007.20	0.2150000	82.640	19,007.20	16337	1	Assumption
31510	1,595.000	1	87.000	The William G. Helis Co., LLC	27,189.24	0.2250000	87.000	27,189.24	16338	1	Jefferson/Lafourche
31511	71.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31512	20.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31513	46.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31514	74.720			No Bid							Plaquemines
31515	600.000	1	166.000	Hobo Resources, Inc.	47,393.00	0.2250000	166.000	47,393.00	16339	1	Plaquemines
31516	815.000	1	90.000	Hobo Resources, Inc.	25,695.00	0.2250000	90.000	25,695.00	16340	1	Plaquemines

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: December 9, 1998

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
31517	680.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31518	1,300.000	1	305.000	Hobo Resources, Inc.	59,017.50	0.2250000	305.000	59,017.50	16341	1	Plaquemines
31519	2,266.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31520	1,899.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31521	1,881.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31522	1,464.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31523	1,347.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31524	837.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31525	876.000	1	572.000	McGinty-Durham, Inc.	102,245.00	0.2150000	REJECTED				Plaquemines
31526	1,171.000	1	194.000	McGinty-Durham, Inc.	34,677.50	0.2150000	REJECTED				Plaquemines
31527	555.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31528	10.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31529	41.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31530	31.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
Totals	56,220.690		3,253.350		\$726,491.15		2,407.350	\$585,568.65		12	