

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: June 9, 1999

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
31851	10.000	1	10.000	Angelle & Donohue Oil & Gas Prop. Inc.	1,650.00	0.2050000	REJECTED				Calcasieu
31852	23.000	1	23.000	Louisiana Oil & Gas Inc.	5,750.00	0.2500000	23.000	5,750.00	16448	1	St. Mary
31853	20.000	1	20.000	Louisiana Oil & Gas Inc.	5,000.00	0.2500000	20.000	5,000.00	16449	1	St. Mary
31854	1,636.000	1	8.850	Cypress Energy Corporation	2,230.20	0.2250000	8.850	2,230.20	16450	1	St. Mary/Terrebonne
31855	1,583.000	1	38.570	The Meridian Res. & Explor. Co.	5,206.95	0.2150000	38.570	5,206.95	16451	1	Terrebonne
31856	535.000	1	142.000	The Meridian Res. & Explor. Co.	32,944.00	0.2150000	142.000	32,944.00	16452	1	Terrebonne
31857	1,687.000	1	80.350	The Meridian Res. & Explor. Co.	10,847.25	0.2150000	80.350	10,847.25	16453	1	Terrebonne
31858	2,217.000	1	148.760	The Meridian Res. & Explor. Co.	20,082.60	0.2150000	148.760	20,082.60	16454	1	Terrebonne
31859	2,150.030	1	309.920	The Meridian Res. & Explor. Co.	41,839.20	0.2150000	309.920	41,839.20	16455	1	Terrebonne
31860	1,726.000			No Bid							Terrebonne
31861	2,313.000			No Bid							Terrebonne
31862	1,421.000			No Bid							Terrebonne
31863	2,232.000			No Bid							Terrebonne
31864	2,180.350			No Bid							Terrebonne
31865	2,002.260			No Bid							Terrebonne
31866	222.000			No Bid							Terrebonne
31867	1,017.740			No Bid							Terrebonne
31868	89.530	1	89.530	South Louisiana Minerals, Inc.	18,900.00	0.2250000	89.530	18,900.00	16456	1	Jefferson
31869	167.130			No Bid							Jefferson
31870	62.000	1	62.000	Texaco E & P, Inc.	17,856.00	0.2250000	62.000	17,856.00	16457	1	Jefferson
31871	529.000			No Bid							Plaquemines/St. Bernard
31872	505.000	1	26.000	WLB Investments, Inc.	4,862.00	0.2100000	26.000	4,862.00	16458	1	Plaquemines/St. Bernard
31873	2,225.000			No Bid							Plaquemines/St. Bernard
31874	1,878.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31875	1,335.000			No Bid							Plaquemines/St. Bernard
31876	672.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31877	1,097.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31878	1,607.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31879	1,902.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31880	2,140.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31881	1,891.000	1	133.000	WLB Investments, Inc.	18,221.00	0.2100000	133.000	18,221.00	16459	1	Plaquemines
31882	1,861.000	1	485.000	WLB Investments, Inc.	66,445.00	0.2100000					Plaquemines
31882		2	472.000	The William G. Helis Co., LLC	111,864.00	0.2150000	472.000	111,864.00	16460	1	Plaquemines
31883	1,612.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31884	1,838.000			No Bid							Plaquemines

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: June 9, 1999

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
31885	2,436.000	1	656.000	WLB Investments, Inc.	93,152.00	0.2100000	656.000	93,152.00	16461	1	Plaquemines
31886	2,285.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31887	847.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31888	2,170.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31889	2,398.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31890	2,446.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31891	1,494.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31892	2,290.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31893	1,850.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
31894	1,774.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
Totals	64,376.040		2,704.980		\$456,850.20		2,209.980	\$388,755.20		14	