

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: August 11, 1999

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
31971	4.000	1	4.000	Sandstone Exploration LLC	200.00	0.1875000	4.000	200.00	16502	1	Bossier
31972	238.940	1	238.940	Martin Acquisition LLC	7,168.20	0.2000000	REJECT				Caddo
31973	0.760	1	0.760	PennzEnergy Explor. & Prod. LLC	114.00	0.2150000	0.760	114.00	16503	1	DeSoto
31974	27.000	1	27.000	Cash River Exploration, Inc.	10,946.07	0.2500000	27.000	10,946.07	16504	1	Jefferson Davis
31975	47.000	1	47.000	Cash River Exploration, Inc.	19,054.27	0.2500000	47.000	19,054.27	16505	1	Jefferson Davis
31976	9.000			No Bid							Calcasieu
31977	32.000			No Bid							Calcasieu
31978	13.000			No Bid							Calcasieu
31979	7.000			No Bid							Calcasieu
31980	20.000			No Bid							Calcasieu
31981	117.000			No Bid							Calcasieu
31982	904.000	1	244.920	Mayne & Mertz, Inc.	49,718.76	0.2300000	244.920	49,718.76	16506	1	Calcasieu
31983	455.280	1	134.750	Mayne & Mertz, Inc.	27,354.25	0.2300000	134.750	27,354.25	16507	1	Calcasieu
31984	121.130	1	41.580	Mayne & Mertz, Inc.	8,440.74	0.2300000	41.580	8,440.74	16508	1	Calcasieu
31985	1,031.000			No Bid							Calcasieu
31986	1,533.000			No Bid							Cameron
31987	1,769.380			No Bid							Cameron
31988	2,014.000			No Bid							Cameron
31989	1,935.000			No Bid							Cameron
31990	1,951.000			No Bid							Cameron
31991	2,500.000			No Bid							Cameron
31992	877.000			No Bid							Vermilion
31993	40.000	1	40.000	South Louisiana Minerals, Inc.	10,000.00	0.2450000	40.000	10,000.00	16509	1	St. Martin
31994	1,400.000	1	732.000	Cabot Oil & Gas Corp.	165,432.00	0.2250000	732.000	165,432.00	16510	1	Terrebonne
31995	214.000	1	146.000	Cabot Oil & Gas Corp.	32,996.00	0.2250000	146.000	32,996.00	16511	1	Terrebonne
Totals	17,260.490		1,656.950		\$331,424.29		1,418.010	\$324,256.09		10	