

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: October 13, 1999

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
32079	225.000	1	225.000	Santa Fe Snyder Corp.	17,100.00	0.2100000	225.000	17,100.00	16559	1	Quachita
32080	39.000	1	18.000	Angelle Donohue Oil & Gas Inc.	3,618.00	0.2250000	18.000	3,618.00	16560	1	Calcasieu
32081	50.000			No Bid							Calcasieu
32082	78.000			No Bid							Calcasieu
32083	77.000			No Bid							Calcasieu
32084	75.000	1	18.000	Angelle Donohue Oil & Gas Inc.	3,618.00	0.2250000	18.000	3,618.00	16561	1	Calcasieu
32085	5.000			No Bid							Calcasieu
32086	6.000	1	3.512	Petro Land Resources, Inc.	1,158.96	0.2500000	3.512	1,158.96	16562	1	Lafayette/St. Martin
32087	857.610			No Bid							St. Mary
32088	1,350.000			No Bid							Terrebonne
32089	2,500.000			No Bid							Terrebonne
32090	2,500.000			No Bid							Terrebonne
32091	2,116.000			No Bid							Terrebonne
32092	1,518.000			No Bid							Lafourche
32093	874.000	1	133.000	K-Exploration Company	20,282.50	0.2200000	133.000	20,282.50	16563	1	Lafourche
32093		2	106.000	K-Exploration Company	16,165.00	0.2200000	106.000	16,165.00	16564	1	Lafourche
32094	483.150	1	53.940	Yuma Explor. & Prod. Co. Inc	18,932.94	0.2150000	53.940	18,932.94	16565	1	Jefferson
32095	0.000			Withdrawn							
32096	0.000			Withdrawn							
32097	0.000			Withdrawn							
32098	0.000			Withdrawn							
32099	0.000			Withdrawn							
32100	821.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32101	294.000	1	67.040	McGinty-Durham Inc.	15,922.00	0.2250000	67.040	15,922.00	16566	1	Plaquemines
32102	630.000	1	43.160	McGinty-Durham Inc.	10,638.94	0.2250000	43.160	10,638.94	16567	1	Plaquemines
32103	1,161.000	1	59.690	McGinty-Durham Inc.	14,176.38	0.2250000	59.690	14,176.38	16568	1	Plaquemines
32104	1,464.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32105	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines
32106	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines
32107	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines
32108	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: October 13, 1999

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
32109	2,497.270	1	634.140	WLB Investments, Inc.	95,755.14	0.2050000	634.140	95,755.14	16569	1	Plaquemines
32110	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines
32111	2,250.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32112	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines
32113	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines
32114	2,322.800			No Bid							Plaquemines
32115	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines
32116	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines
32117	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines
32118	1,727.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32119	1,985.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32120	2,357.730	1	354.170	WLB Investments, Inc.	106,959.34	0.2100000	354.170	106,959.34	16570	1	Plaquemines
32121	1,011.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32122	583.560	1	112.320	Yuma Explor. & Prod. Co. Inc	39,424.32	0.2150000	112.320	39,424.32	16571	1	Jefferson
32122		2	90.590	Yuma Explor. & Prod. Co. Inc	15,853.25	0.2150000	90.590	15,853.25	16572	1	Jefferson
Totals	56,830.820		1,918.562		\$379,604.77		1,918.562	\$379,604.77		14	