

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: December 8, 1999

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
32211	60.000	1	60.000	Bonne Terre Exploration Co., LLC	15,000.00	0.2500000	60.000	15,000.00	16605	1	Calcasieu/Cameron
32212	68.000			No Bid							Cameron
32213	16.000			No Bid							Avoyelles
32214	1,259.000			No Bid							St. Mary
32215	1,735.000	1	423.650	Sonat Exploration GOM, Inc.	172,849.20	0.2100000	423.650	172,849.20	16606	1	St. Mary
32216	2,500.000			No Bid							St. Martin/St. Mary
32217	2,428.000			No Bid							St. Martin/St. Mary
32218	73.000	1	9.000	Solex Corporation	1,305.00	0.2100000	9.000	1,305.00	16607	1	Lafourche/St. James
32218		2	8.500	Solex Corporation	1,232.50	0.2100000	8.500	1,232.50	16608	1	Lafourche/St. James
32219	488.000	1	488.000	Texaco E & P, Inc.	122,488.00	0.2200000	488.000	122,488.00	16609	1	Jefferson
32220	2,497.270			No Bid							St. Bernard
32221	2,497.270			No Bid							St. Bernard
32222	2,497.270			No Bid							St. Bernard
32223	2,497.270			No Bid							St. Bernard
32224	1,845.120			No Bid							Plaquemines/St. Bernard
32225	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines/St. Bernard
32226	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines
32227	2,054.210	1	538.910	WLB Investments, Inc.	92,153.61	0.2100000	538.910	92,153.61	16610	1	Plaquemines
32227		2	122.930	WLB Investments, Inc.	18,562.43	0.2050000	122.930	18,562.43	16611	1	Plaquemines
32227		3	329.550	WLB Investments, Inc.	49,762.05	0.2050000	329.550	49,762.05	16612	1	Plaquemines
32228	16.070	1	16.070	WLB Investments, Inc.	2,747.97	0.2100000	16.070	2,747.97	16613	1	Plaquemines
32229	1,654.540	1	424.700	WLB Investments, Inc.	72,623.70	0.2100000	424.700	72,623.70	16614	1	Plaquemines
32230	431.850			No Bid							Plaquemines
32231	2,488.810	1	36.160	WLB Investments, Inc.	5,460.16	0.2050000	36.160	5,460.16	16615	1	Plaquemines
32232	1,455.250			No Bid							Plaquemines
Totals	33,556.470		2,457.470		\$554,184.62		2,457.470	\$554,184.62		11	