OFFSHORE BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: September 8, 1999

Tract Advertised  No. Acres Bonus Accepted Accepted State
Number Acreage Bid Bid Bidder Bid Royalty Acres Bonus Leases Parish
32005 1,826.740 1 300.830 | Bois D'Arc Offshore Ltd. 67,987.58 0.2100000 300.830 67,987.58 16528 Terrebonne
32006 2,187.610 1 1,474.440 | Texaco E & P, Inc. 368,610.00 0.2200000 1,474.440 368,610.00 16529 Terrebonne
32007 1,989.230 No Bid Terrebonne
32008 435.720 No Bid Terrebonne
32009 1,467.380 No Bid Terrebonne
32010 2,500.000 No Bid Terrebonne
32011 1,256.920 No Bid Lafourche/Terrebonne
32012 2,099.480 No Bid Lafourche/Terrebonne
32013 2,500.000 No Bid Lafourche/Terrebonne
Totals 16,263.080 1,775.270 $436,597.58 1,775.270 $436,597.58




