

OFFSHORE BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: December 8, 1999

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
32199	1,035.780			No Bid							Cameron
32200	2,500.000			No Bid							Cameron
32201	1,867.130			No Bid							Cameron
32202	1,411.370			No Bid							Cameron
32203	1,411.370			No Bid							Cameron
32204	1,214.970			No Bid							Cameron
32205	2,500.000			No Bid							Cameron
32206	1,713.790			No Bid							Cameron
32207	1,713.780			No Bid							Cameron
32208	1,974.070	1	1,974.070	Cypress Energy Corporation	352,391.24	0.2100000	1,974.070	352,391.24	16602	1	Terrebonne
32208		2	795.650	AD Ventures, Inc.	239,490.65	0.2100000					Terrebonne
32209	1,456.500	1	525.660	AD Ventures, Inc.	158,223.66	0.2100000	525.660	158,223.66	16603	1	Terrebonne
32210	175.600	1	175.600	Stone Energy Corp.	71,996.00	0.2200000	175.600	71,996.00	16604	1	Terrebonne
Totals	18,974.360		3,470.980		\$822,101.55		2,675.330	\$582,610.90		3	