Louisiana Department of Natural Resources (DNR)

I SONRIS/2000

Report run on:  Nov 9, 2000 9:50 AM DATE: November 8, 2000

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

Tract Advertised  No. Acres Bidder Bonus Royalty Accepted Accepted State Parish

Number Acreage  Bid Bid Bld Acres Bonus Leases

32866 24000 1 24.000 STROUD PRODUCTION LLC 3,744.00  0.1875000 24.000 3,744.00 16873 1 Winn, Natchitoches

32867 136.000 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Cameron

32868 112.000 1 112.000 STEVEN M. JENKINS & ASSOCIATES INC. 68,320.00  0.2500000 112.000 68,320.00 16874 1 Cameron

32869 132.000 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Cameron

32870 141.000 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Cameron

32871 614.000 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Cameron

32872 367.000 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Cameron

32873 156.000 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Cameron

32874 51.000 1 51.000 PETROQUEST ENERGY I LLC 15,861.00  0.2500000 51.000 15,861.00 16875 1 Cameron

32874 51.000 2 20.000 VICTOR P. SMITH OIL COMPANY, LLC 4,040.00  0.2200000 Cameron

32875 309.000 1 309.000 SAMPSON RESOURCES 69,000.00  0.2250000 309.000 69,000.00 16876 1 Vermilion
COMPANY/HELMERICH & PAYNE INC.

32876 44000 1 44.000 CHESAPEAKE LA LP/CHESAPEAKE 6,776.00  0.2250000 44.000 6,776.00 16877 1 Rapides, Evangeline
OPERATING INC. GENERAL PARTNER

32877 35.000 1 35.000 CHESAPEAKE LA LP/CHESAPEAKE 5,390.00  0.2250000 35.000 5,390.00 16878 1 Rapides, Evangeline
OPERATING INC. GENERAL PARTNER

32878 512.000 1 0.000 WITHDRAWN 0.00  0.0000000 Saint Mary

32879 23.000 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Terrebonne,

Lafourche
32880 98.000 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Lafourche
32881 38.000 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Terrebonne,
Lafourche

32882 1,370.000 1 628.000 HUNT OIL COMPANY 94,828.00  0.2400000 628.000 94,828.00 16879 1 Lafourche, Jefferson

32882 1,370.000 2 159.974 LDF EXPLORATION & DEVELOPMENT 24,196.07  0.2050000 Lafourche, Jefferson
LLC

32883 320.000 1 320.000 HUNT OIL COMPANY 54,720.00  0.2400000 320.000 54,720.00 16880 1 Jefferson

32884 799.000 1 799.000 HUNT OIL COMPANY 333,982.00  0.2500000 799.000 333,982.00 16881 1 Lafourche, Jefferson

32885 1,477.000 1 1,477.000 HUNT OIL COMPANY 474,117.00  0.2420000 1,477.000 474,117.00 16882 1 Lafourche, Jefferson

32886 257.000 1 257.000 VINTAGE PETROLEUM INC. 89,950.00  0.2500000 257.000 89,950.00 16883 1 Plaguemines

32887 314.000 1 314.000 VINTAGE PETROLEUM INC. 94,200.00  0.2500000 314.000 94,200.00 16884 1 Plaguemines

32887 314.000 2 119.000 CHEVRON USA INC./RIDGELAKE 26,775.00  0.2200000 Plaquemines
ENERGY, INC.

32888 158.000 1 158.000 VINTAGE PETROELUM INC. 55,300.00  0.2500000 Plaquemines

32888 158.000 2 158.000 CHEVRON USA INC./RIDGELAKE 59,250.00  0.2510000 158.000 59,250.00 16885 1 Plaguemines
ENERGY, INC.
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32889 100.000 1 8.000 PRIDE OIL & GAS PROPERTIES, INC. 4,456.00  0.2500000 8.000 4,456.00 16886 1 Plaguemines
32890 2,497.270 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32891 1,591.480 1 215.240 ROBERT A. SCHROEDER, INC. 27,981.20  0.2100000 215.240 27,981.20 16887 1 Plaguemines
32891 1,591.480 2 5.700 ROBERT A. SCHROEDER, INC. 860.70  0.2100000 5.700 860.70 16888 1 Plaguemines
32892 2,322.800 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32893 1,523.760 1 46.520 ROBERT A. SCHROEDER, INC. 6,047.60  0.2100000 46.520 6,047.60 16889 1 Plaguemines
32893 1,523.760 2 270.150 ROBERT A. SCHROEDER, INC. 40,792.65  0.2100000 270.150 40,792.65 16890 1 Plaguemines
32894 1,879.300 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32895 513.920 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32896 2,267.740 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32897 1,262.480 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32898 600.650 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32899 2,497.270 1 73.960 ROBERT A. SCHROEDER, INC. 9,614.80  0.2100000 73.960 9,614.80 16891 1 Plaguemines
32899 2,497.270 2 38.920 ROBERT A. SCHROEDER, INC. 5,059.60  0.2100000 38.920 5,059.60 16892 1 Plaguemines
32900 2,250.000 1 550.060 ROBERT A. SCHROEDER, INC. 71,507.80  0.2100000 550.060 71,507.80 16893 1 Plaguemines
32901 1,335.260 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32902 1,078.400 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32903 771.170 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32904 2,497.270 1 1,298.190 ROBERT A. SCHROEDER, INC. 168,764.70  0.2100000 1,298.190 168,764.70 16894 1 Plaguemines
32905 2,497.270 1 1,061.490 ROBERT A. SCHROEDER, INC. 137,993.70  0.2100000 1,061.490 137,993.70 16895 1 Plaguemines
32906 1,432.000 1 179.000 PRIDE OIL & GAS PROPERTIES, INC. 59,607.00  0.2100000 179.000 59,607.00 16896 1 Plaguemines
32907 976.000 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Saint Bernard
32908 796.000 1 109.880 ROBERT A. SCHROEDER, INC. 16,591.88  0.2100000 109.880 16,591.88 16897 1 Saint Bernard
32909 574.000 1 12.240 ROBERT A. SCHROEDER, INC. 1,848.24  0.2100000 12.240 1,848.24 16898 1 Saint Bernard
Total: 38,751.040 8,854.324 $2,031,574.94 8,397.350 $1,921,263.87 26
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Strategic Online Natu form:
SONRIS/2000

OFFSHORE BID TRACT SHEET

Tract

Number

32839
32840
32841
32842
32843
32844

32845

32846
32846

32847
32848
32849
32850
32851
32852
32853
32854
32855
32856
32857
32858
32859
32860
32861
32862
32863
32864
32865
Total:

Advertised
Acreage
2,500.000
2,304.930
754.460
97.250
1,061.580
2,157.970

2,120.020

822.920
822.920

88.910
451.540
1,371.000
2,363.810
495.430
2,497.270
1,248.640
1,248.640
1,661.940
1,650.000
1,307.580
1,686.930
2,201.620
1,422.710
1,839.000
774.250
2,070.180
2,481.000
2,491.000
41,170.580

Nov 9, 2000 9:50 AM

Acres

Bid

0.000
573.920
0.000
0.000
0.000
1,189.000

259.000

822.920
470.000

88.910
451.540
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
0.000
3,855.290
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Bidder

NO BID
BPR ENERGY INC.
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

IP PETROLEUM CO./ANDEX RESOURCES
LLC

IP PETROLEUM CO. INC./ANDEX
RESOURCES LLC

ENERGY PARTNERS LTD

IP PETROLEUM CO. INC./ANDEX
RESOURCES LLC
W & T OFFSHORE INC.

W & T OFFSHORE INC.
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

Bonus

Bid

0.00
100,000.00
0.00

0.00

0.00
149,814.00

51,800.00

251,813.52
59,690.00

26,939.73
136,816.62
0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00
$776,873.87

Royalty

0.0000000
0.2200000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.2100000

0.2100000

0.2300000
0.2100000

0.2100000
0.2100000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000
0.0000000

Accepted
Acres

573.920

259.000

822.920

88.910
451.540

2,196.290

Accepted
Bonus

100,000.00

51,800.00

251,813.52

26,939.73
136,816.62

$567,369.87

State
Leases

16868

REJECTED

16869

16870

16871
16872

Parish

Iberia
Iberia
Iberia
Plaquemines
Plaguemines
Plaquemines

Plaquemines

Plaguemines
Plaquemines

Plaquemines
Plaguemines
Plaguemines
Plaquemines
Plaquemines
Plaguemines
Plaguemines
Plaguemines
Plaquemines
Plaguemines
Plaguemines
Plaguemines
Plaquemines
Plaguemines
Plaguemines
Plaguemines
Plaquemines
Plaguemines
Plaguemines



Louisiana Department of Natural Resources (DNR)

SONRIS/2000

Report run on:  Nov 9, 2000 9:50 AM DATE: November 8, 2000

PASS-A-LOUTRE BID TRACT SHEET

Tract Advertised  No. Acres Bidder Bonus Royalty Accepted Accepted State Parish
Number Acreage  Bid Bid Bld Acres Bonus Leases

32916 1,934.000 1 265.000 CYPRESS ENERGY CORP. 180,552.45  0.2630000 Plaguemines
32916 1,934.000 2 690.000 PRIDE OIL & GAS PROPERTIES, INC. 384,330.00  0.2500000 690.000 384,330.00 16901 1 Plaguemines
32917 529.540 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32918 617.530 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32919 997.470 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32920 1,060.610 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32921 665.110 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
32922 1,060.610 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Plaguemines
Total: 6,864.870 955.000 $564,882.45 690.000 $384,330.00 1
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Louisiana Department of Natural Resources (DNR)

SONRIS/2000

Report run on:  Nov 9, 2000 9:50 AM DATE: November 8, 2000

STATE AGENCY BID TRACT SHEET

Tract Advertised  No. Acres Bidder Bonus Royalty Accepted Accepted State Parish
Number Acreage  Bid Bid Bld Acres Bonus Leases
32910 20.000 1 20.000 CLARK ENERGY COMPANY INC. 25,200.00  0.2700000 20.000 25,200.00 16899 1 Webster
32910 20.000 2 20.000 COHART ENERGY COMPANY 10,020.00  0.2450000 Webster
32911 8.000 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Ouachita
32912 40.000 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Ouachita
32913 0.000 1 0.000 WITHDRAWN 0.00  0.0000000 Lafayette
32914 640.000 0.000 NO BID 0.00  0.0000000 Terrebonne,
Lafourche
32915 490.410 1 67.500 MARTIN MARKS MINERALS LLC 16,875.00  0.2500000 67.500 16,875.00 16900 1 Lafourche, Jefferson
Total: 1,198.410 107.500 $52,095.00 87.500 $42,075.00
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