

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: February 9, 2000

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
32317	28.503	1	28.503	Questar Explor. & Prod. Co.	4,332.46	0.1875000	28.503	4,332.46	16641	1	Bossier/Caddo
32318	2.500			No Bid							Vernon
32319	33.000			No Bid							Vernon
32320	121.000			No Bid							Vernon
32321	10.000	1	10.000	Union Pacific Resources Co.	1,250.00	0.2500000	REJECTED				Vernon
32322	39.000	1	39.000	Union Pacific Resources Co.	4,875.00	0.2500000	REJECTED				Vernon
32323	10.000	1	10.000	Swift Energy Company	2,500.00	0.2500000	10.000	2,500.00	16642	1	Rapides
32324	60.000	1	15.615	Cash River Exploration, Inc.	3,123.00	0.2250000	REJECTED				Calcasieu
32325	668.000			No Bid							Calcasieu
32326	19.000			No Bid							Acadia
32327	75.000			No Bid							St. Mary/Terrebonne
32328	104.000	1	45.000	Kevin Caliva & Associates LTD	15,828.75	0.2100000					St. Mary/Terrebonne
32328		2	3.000	Sandoz & Assoc., Inc.	10,002.00	0.2500000	3.000	10,002.00	16643	1	St. Mary/Terrebonne
32329	579.000			No Bid							St. Mary/Terrebonne
32330	118.000			No Bid							St. Mary/Terrebonne
32331	1,298.000	1	405.000	Cabot Oil & Gas Corporation	101,655.00	0.2255000	405.000	101,655.00	16644	1	St. Mary/Terrebonne
32332	70.000	1	38.000	Cabot Oil & Gas Corporation	9,538.00	0.2255000	38.000	9,538.00	16645	1	Terrebonne
32333	46.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32334	434.000	1	206.000	McGinty-Durham, Inc.	50,779.00	0.2250000	206.000	50,779.00	16646	1	Plaquemines
32335	821.000	1	102.000	Core Energy Group, Inc.	23,358.00	0.2050000	102.000	23,358.00	16647	1	Plaquemines
32336	179.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32337	1,097.000	1	213.000	BH Petroleum, Inc.	54,741.00	0.2050000	213.000	54,741.00	16648	1	Plaquemines
32338	1,607.000	1	81.220	WLB Investments, Inc.	12,264.22	0.2100000	81.220	12,264.22	16649	1	Plaquemines
32338		2	170.000	BH Petroleum, Inc.	43,690.00	0.2050000	170.000	43,690.00	16650	1	Plaquemines
32339	1,902.000	1	197.000	Pride Oil & Gas Properties, Inc.	44,719.00	0.2050000	197.000	44,719.00	16651	1	Plaquemines
32340	2,140.000	1	324.000	Pride Oil & Gas Properties, Inc.	73,548.00	0.2050000	324.000	73,548.00	16652	1	Plaquemines
32341	1,758.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32342	1,228.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32343	1,039.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32344	1,612.000	1	311.000	Pride Oil & Gas Properties, Inc.	70,597.00	0.2050000	311.000	70,597.00	16653	1	Plaquemines
32345	1,838.000	1	387.000	Pride Oil & Gas Properties, Inc.	87,849.00	0.2050000	387.000	87,849.00	16654	1	Plaquemines
32346	1,780.000	1	919.000	Cypress Energy Corporation	208,613.00	0.2050000	919.000	208,613.00	16655	1	Plaquemines

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: February 9, 2000

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
32347	2,285.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32348	2,225.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32349	847.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32350	2,170.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32351	2,398.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32352	2,446.000	1	992.810	WBL Investments, Inc.	129,065.30	0.2100000	992.810	129,065.30	16656	1	Plaquemines
32353	2,100.000	1	57.800	WBL Investments, Inc.	7,514.00	0.2100000	57.800	7,514.00	16657	1	Plaquemines
32354	1,494.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32355	2,290.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32356	1,850.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32357	1,700.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32358	1,810.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32359	1,774.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32360	1,625.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32361	2,439.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32362	2,400.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32363	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines
32364	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines
32365	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines
32366	1,831.650	1	553.410	WBL Investments, Inc.	95,186.52	0.2100000	553.410	95,186.52	16658	1	Plaquemines
32367	555.410			No Bid							Plaquemines
32368	183.430			No Bid							Plaquemines
32369	1,484.960	1	629.020	WBL Investments, Inc.	108,191.44	0.2100000	629.020	108,191.44	16659	1	Plaquemines
32370	2,497.270			No Bid							St. Bernard
32371	2,497.270			No Bid							St. Bernard
32372	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines/St. Bernard
32373	2,497.270			No Bid							St. Bernard/Plaquemines
32374	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines/St. Bernard
32375	2,497.270			No Bid							Plaquemines/St. Bernard
32376	24.735	1	24.735	Matrix Oil & Gas, Inc.	18,551.25	0.3333333	24.735	18,551.25	16660	1	Plaquemines
32377	2,292.300	1	703.020	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	281,208.00	0.2100000	703.020	281,208.00	16661	1	Plaquemines
32377		2	269.390	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	323,268.00	0.2100000	269.390	323,268.00	16662	1	Plaquemines

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: February 9, 2000

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
32378	674.370			No Bid							Plaquemines
32379	2,414.310			No Bid							Plaquemines
32380	476.790	1	176.570	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	211,884.00	0.2100000	176.570	211,884.00	16663	1	Plaquemines
32381	1,790.000	1	602.660	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	182,003.32	0.2100000	602.660	182,003.32	16664	1	Plaquemines
32381		2	80.250	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	17,655.00	0.2100000	80.250	17,655.00	16665	1	Plaquemines
32381		3	218.080	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	87,232.00	0.2100000	218.080	87,232.00	16666	1	Plaquemines
32382	1,011.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
32383	1,560.000	1	466.170	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	186,468.00	0.2100000	466.170	186,468.00	16667	1	Plaquemines
32384	1,550.000	1	81.920	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	32,768.00	0.2100000	81.920	32,768.00	16668	1	Plaquemines
32385	1,596.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
92,489.388			8,360.173		\$2,504,257.26		8,250.558	\$2,479,180.51		28	