

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: July 12, 2000

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases	Parish
32616	40.000	1	5.000	Palmer Petroleum, Inc.	765.00	0.2500000	5.000	765.00	16782	1 Red River
32617	40.000			No Bid						Sabine
32618	93.000			No Bid						Sabine
32619	81.000			No Bid						Sabine
32620	106.000			No Bid						Sabine
32621	135.000			No Bid						Sabine
32622	0.000			Withdrawn						
32623	0.000			Withdrawn						
32624	9.000			No Bid						Calcasieu
32625	83.000			No Bid						Calcasieu
32626	50.000	1	16.000	Cash River Exploration, Inc.	3,200.00	0.2200000	16.000	3,200.00	16783	1 Calcasieu
32627	12.128	1	12.128	Samson Resources Co.	3,032.00	0.2500000	12.128	3,032.00	16784	1 Calcasieu
32628	40.000			No Bid						Rapides
32629	1.000			No Bid						Rapides
32630	16.000	1	16.000	JB Hanks Company, Inc.	1,608.00	0.1875000	16.000	1,608.00	16785	1 Avoyelles
32631	407.030			No Bid						Vermilion
32632	311.680			No Bid						Vermilion
32633	315.680	1	315.680	Browning Oil Company, Inc.	111,435.04	0.2500000	315.680	111,435.04	16786	1 Vermilion
32634	813.440			No Bid						Vermilion
32635	703.620	1	260.350	Browning Oil Company, Inc.	65,868.55	0.2500000	260.350	65,868.55	16787	1 Vermilion
32636	640.000			No Bid						Vermilion
32637	461.510			No Bid						Vermilion
32638	800.000			No Bid						Vermilion
32639	481.330			No Bid						Vermilion
32640	800.000			No Bid						Vermilion
32641	57.000	1	42.000	Southwestern Energy Production Co.	17,892.00	0.2250000	42.000	17,892.00	16788	1 St. Martin
32642	68.000			No Bid						St. Martin
32643	884.000			No Bid						Assumption
32644	288.500			No Bid						Assumption
32645	473.520	1	382.260	Gulf Coast Oil Properties, Inc.	46,253.46	0.2200000	REJECTED			Assumption
32646	951.000	1	298.000	Gulf Coast Oil Properties, Inc.	91,188.00	0.2200000	298.000	91,188.00	16789	1 Assumption
32647	439.000	1	439.000	Texaco Explor. & Prod., Inc./LL&E	153,650.00	0.2100000	439.000	153,650.00	16790	1 Terrebonne
32647		2	439.000	Texaco Explor. & Prod., Inc./LL&E	109,750.00	0.2300000				Terrebonne
32648	337.000			No Bid						Terrebonne
32649	573.000	1	139.810	Texaco Explor. & Prod., Inc./LL&E	27,962.00	0.2100000	139.810	27,962.00	16791	1 Terrebonne
32650	5.000			No Bid						Lafourche
32651	8.000			No Bid						Lafourche
32652	725.000			No Bid						Plaquemines
32653	606.000			No Bid						Plaquemines
32654	705.000	1	6.000	Cypress Energy Corporation	1,506.00	0.2000000	6.000	1,506.00	16792	1 Plaquemines
32655	1,761.000			No Bid						Plaquemines
32656	2,497.270			No Bid						Plaquemines
32657	1,785.000	1	275.500	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	41,600.50	0.2100000	275.500	41,600.50	16793	1 Plaquemines

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: July 12, 2000

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases	Parish
32658	1,650.000			No Bid						Plaquemines
32659	1,304.000	1	147.980	Dimension Energy Co. LLC	44,394.00	0.2300000	147.980	44,394.00	16794	1 Plaquemines
32660	1,369.160			No Bid						Plaquemines
32661	2,497.270			No Bid						Plaquemines
32662	2,098.800	1	382.000	3 Tech Energy Corporation	153,182.00	0.2250000	382.000	153,182.00	16795	1 Plaquemines
32662		2	280.010	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	141,405.05	0.2100000				Plaquemines
32663	743.150			No Bid						Plaquemines
32664	2,497.270			No Bid						Plaquemines
32665	2,497.270	1	511.210	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	258,161.05	0.2100000	511.210	258,161.05	16796	1 Plaquemines
32666	2,497.270	1	317.920	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	48,005.92	0.2100000	317.920	48,005.92	16797	1 Plaquemines
32667	1,755.000			No Bid						St. Bernard
32668	2,401.370	1	826.550	North Central Oil Corp.	206,844.14	0.2050000				St. Bernard
32668		2	160.010	North Central Oil Corp.	128,008.00	0.2050000	160.010	128,008.00	16798	1 St. Bernard
32669	982.000			No Bid						St. Bernard
32670	2,418.000			No Bid						St. Bernard
32671	1,887.770			No Bid						St. Bernard
32672	2,497.270	1	1,346.950	North Central Oil Corp.	370,747.99	0.2050000	1,346.950	370,747.99	16799	1 St. Bernard
32673	2,448.000			No Bid						St. Bernard
32674	2,465.000			No Bid						St. Bernard
	52,612.308		6,619.358		\$2,026,458.70		4,691.538	\$1,522,206.05	18	