

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: October 11, 2000

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases	Parish
32811	174.000			No Bid						Avoyelles/Concordia
32812	26.000	1	26.000	Bridas Energy USA, Inc.	9,282.00	0.2500000	26.000	9,282.00	16856	1 Iberville
32813	163.770	1	163.770	Bridas Energy USA, Inc.	58,465.89	0.2500000	163.770	58,465.89	16857	1 Iberville
32814	402.000	1	20.000	EnerVest Energy LP	4,500.00	0.2500000	20.000	4,500.00	16858	1 Iberia/St. Martin
32815	1,962.000			No Bid						St. Mary
32816	1,160.000	1	594.000	Hunt Oil Co/Preston Explor. Co. LP/Preston Interest Oper LP/N. Central Oil Corp.	366,498.00	0.2500000	594.000	366,498.00	16859	1 St. Mary
32817	1,791.000	1	1,286.000	Hunt Oil Co/N. Central Oil Corp.	487,152.00	0.2500000	1,286.000	487,152.00	16860	1 St. Mary
32818	1,841.810			No Bid						St. Mary
32819	259.000	1	158.000	Hunt Oil Company	41,396.00	0.2250000	158.000	41,396.00	16861	1 St. Mary
32820	473.520			No Bid						Assumption
32821	1,075.000	1	343.310	Petro-Hunt LLC	156,892.67	0.2100000				Assumption
32821		2	337.270	Prime Natural Res. Inc./Andex Res. LLC	269,816.00	0.2500000	337.270	269,816.00	16862	1 Assumption
32822	1,030.000			No Bid						Assumption
32823	1,062.000			No Bid						Assumption
32824	1,260.000			No Bid						Assumption
32825	11.000	1	11.000	Mandalay Oil & Gas LLC	8,250.00	0.2500000	11.000	8,250.00	16863	1 Terrebonne
32825		2	11.000	Mandalay Oil & Gas LLC	11,550.00	0.2250000				Terrebonne
32826	437.000			No Bid						Terrebonne
32827	1,078.000	1	1,078.000	MVP Production, Inc.	270,578.00	0.2200000	1,078.000	270,578.00	16864	1 Lafourche/St. Charles
32828	387.000	1	387.000	Wichita River Oil Corp.	81,270.00	0.2050000	387.000	81,270.00	16865	1 Jefferson
32829	1,595.000			No Bid						Plaquemines
32830	1,716.800			No Bid						Plaquemines
32831	2,241.360	1	666.540	N. Central Oil Corp.	100,814.18	0.2050000	666.540	100,814.18	16866	1 St. Bernard
	20,146.260		5,081.890		\$1,866,464.74		4,727.580	\$1,698,022.07	11	