

OFFSHORE BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: February 9, 2000

| Tract<br>Number | Advertised<br>Acreage | No.<br>Bid | Acres<br>Bid | Bidder            | Bonus<br>Bid | Royalty   | Accepted<br>Acres | Accepted<br>Bonus | State<br>Leases | Parish     |
|-----------------|-----------------------|------------|--------------|-------------------|--------------|-----------|-------------------|-------------------|-----------------|------------|
| 32290           | 1,352.020             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32291           | 1,066.110             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32292           | 1,328.830             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32293           | 533.680               |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32294           | 1,232.130             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32295           | 1,800.940             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32296           | 2,006.040             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32297           | 2,500.000             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32298           | 2,500.000             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32299           | 1,905.190             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32300           | 1,676.360             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32301           | 2,500.000             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32302           | 2,411.780             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32303           | 627.260               |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32304           | 2,423.280             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32305           | 2,500.000             | 1          | 2,500.000    | Chevron USA, Inc. | 537,500.00   | 0.2100000 | 2,500.000         | 537,500.00        | 16639           | 1 Cameron  |
| 32306           | 2,500.000             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32307           | 879.940               | 1          | 879.940      | Chevron USA, Inc. | 266,640.00   | 0.2100000 | 879.940           | 266,640.00        | 16640           | 1 Cameron  |
| 32308           | 95.530                |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Cameron    |
| 32309           | 1,927.960             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Iberia     |
| 32310           | 2,052.420             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Iberia     |
| 32311           | 1,811.520             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Iberia     |
| 32312           | 2,007.380             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Iberia     |
| 32313           | 2,500.000             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Iberia     |
| 32314           | 2,500.000             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Iberia     |
| 32315           | 2,500.000             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Iberia     |
| 32316           | 1,686.720             |            |              | No Bid            |              |           |                   |                   |                 | Terrebonne |
|                 |                       |            |              |                   |              |           |                   |                   |                 |            |
|                 |                       |            |              |                   |              |           |                   |                   |                 |            |
| Totals          | 48,825.090            |            | 3,379.940    |                   | \$804,140.00 |           | 3,379.940         | \$804,140.00      | 2               |            |