

OFFSHORE BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: July 12, 2000

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
32609	1,790.040			No Bid							Plaquemines
32610	2,292.060	1	1,565.780	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	236,432.78	0.2100000	1,565.780	236,432.78	16779	1	Plaquemines
32611	1,179.000	1	382.370	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	57,737.87	0.2100000	382.370	57,737.87	16780	1	Plaquemines
32612	1,893.000	1	387.110	Dimension Energy Co LLC	116,133.00	0.2300000	387.110	116,133.00	16781	1	Plaquemines
32613	95.730			No Bid							Plaquemines
32614	1,090.160			No Bid							Plaquemines
32615	1,150.690			No Bid							Plaquemines
Totals	9,490.680		2,335.260		\$410,303.65		2,335.260	\$410,303.65	3		