

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
32675	43.880	1	43.880	Phillips Petroleum Co.	6,654.84	0.2500000	43.880	6,654.84	16800	1	Bienville
32676	40.000	1	40.000	Phillips Petroleum Co.	6,000.00	0.2500000	40.000	6,000.00	16801	1	Bienville
32677	80.000	1	80.000	Brookwater Energy, Inc.	5,200.00	0.1875000	80.000	5,200.00	16802	1	Concordia
32678	640.080			No Bid							Calcasieu
32679	493.850			No Bid							Assumption/Lafourche
32680	219.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
Totals	1,516.810		163.880		\$17,854.84		163.880	\$17,854.84		3	

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
32675	43.880	1	43.880	Phillips Petroleum Co.	6,654.84	0.2500000	43.880	6,654.84	16800	1	Bienville
32676	40.000	1	40.000	Phillips Petroleum Co.	6,000.00	0.2500000	40.000	6,000.00	16801	1	Bienville
32677	80.000	1	80.000	Brookwater Energy, Inc.	5,200.00	0.1875000	80.000	5,200.00	16802	1	Concordia
32678	640.080			No Bid							Calcasieu
32679	493.850			No Bid							Assumption/Lafourche
32680	219.000			No Bid							Plaquemines
Totals	1,516.810		163.880		\$17,854.84		163.880	\$17,854.84		3	