

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: August 9, 2000

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases	Parish
32708	238.940			No Bid						Caddo
32709	1,420.000			No Bid						Madison
32710	14.000	1	14.000	Chesapeake LA Lmt'd. Partnership	4,298.00	0.2500000	14.000	4,298.00	16806	1 Rapides
32710		2	14.000	Swift Energy Company	3,010.00	0.2500000				Rapides
32711	42.420	1	42.420	Chesapeake LA Lmt'd. Partnership	13,022.94	0.2500000	42.420	13,022.94	16807	1 Rapides
32711		2	42.420	Swift Energy Company	9,205.14	0.2500000				Rapides
32712	8.000	1	2.890	Cash River Exploration, Inc.	578.00	0.2200000	2.890	578.00	16808	1 Jefferson Davis
32713	12.000	1	7.130	Cash River Exploration, Inc.	1,426.00	0.2200000	7.130	1,426.00	16809	1 Jefferson Davis
32714	28.000	1	28.000	Louisiana Oil & Gas, Inc.	5,012.00	0.2500000	28.000	5,012.00	16810	1 Jefferson Davis
32715	290.000	1	290.000	Upland Exploration, Inc.	145,000.00	0.2300000	290.000	145,000.00	16811	1 Jefferson Davis/Cameron
32715		2	290.000	Starks Oil Corporation	111,940.00	0.2500000				Jefferson Davis/Cameron
32716	22.000			No Bid						Acadia
32717	19.000	1	19.000	Hunt Oil Company	2,964.00	0.2200000	19.000	2,964.00	16812	1 Acadia
32718	12.000	1	12.000	Hunt Oil Company	1,872.00	0.2200000	12.000	1,872.00	16813	1 Acadia
32719	292.000			No Bid						Iberia/St.. Martin
32720	65.000			No Bid						Iberia/St.. Martin
32721	32.000	1	32.000	Hunt Oil Company	11,264.00	0.2550000	32.000	11,264.00	16814	1 St. Martin
32722	193.000	1	193.000	Burlington Resources O & G Co.	193,000.00	0.2700000				Assumption/St. Mary
32722		2	193.000	Burlington Resources O & G Co.	308,800.00	0.2550000	193.000	308,800.00	16815	1 Assumption/St. Mary
32722		3	20.000	Cash River Exploration, Inc.	6,140.00	0.2600000				Assumption/St. Mary
32723	1,812.000	1	176.000	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	44,176.00	0.2100000	176.000	44,176.00	16816	1 Plaquemines
32723		2	204.220	JKL Enterprises, Inc.	56,624.08	0.2250000	204.220	56,624.08	16817	1 Plaquemines
32723		3	148.000	Pride Oil & Gas Properties, Inc.	44,844.00	0.2050000				Plaquemines
32724	215.360			No Bid						Plaquemines
32725	181.580			No Bid						Plaquemines
32726	1,273.000			No Bid						Plaquemines
32727	586.000	1	321.000	The William G. Helis Co., LLC	88,596.00	0.2150000	321.000	88,596.00	16818	1 Plaquemines
32728	777.050			No Bid						Plaquemines
32729	128.940			No Bid						Plaquemines
32730	1,315.000			No Bid						Plaquemines
32731	1,194.470			No Bid						Plaquemines
32732	1,619.290	1	103.330	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	38,852.08	0.2100000	103.330	38,852.08	16819	1 Plaquemines
32733	1,880.740			No Bid						Plaquemines
32734	2,460.000	1	406.340	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	61,763.68	0.2100000	406.340	61,763.68	16820	1 Plaquemines
32735	1,690.940	1	327.370	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	49,760.24	0.2100000	327.370	49,760.24	16821	1 Plaquemines
32736	1,881.190			No Bid						Plaquemines
32737	991.690	1	237.350	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	47,707.35	0.2100000	237.350	47,707.35	16822	1 Plaquemines
32738	2,497.270	1	211.890	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	31,995.39	0.2100000	211.890	31,995.39	16823	1 Plaquemines
32738		2	405.240	Robert A. Schroeder, Inc.	81,453.24	0.2100000	405.240	81,453.24	16824	1 Plaquemines
32739	615.350			No Bid						Plaquemines
32740	447.480			No Bid						Plaquemines
32741	768.340			No Bid						Plaquemines
32742	183.430			No Bid						Plaquemines

INLAND BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: August 9, 2000

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases	Parish
32743	2,148.300			No Bid						Plaquemines
32744	2,275.000	1	378.890	Goodrich Petroleum Co. of LA	76,156.89	0.2100000	378.890	76,156.89	16825	1 Plaquemines
32745	496.000	1	30.200	Bell Exploration, Inc.	1,510.00	0.1875000	30.200	1,510.00	16826	1 LaSalle
32746	501.000	1	85.240	Bell Exploration, Inc.	4,262.00	0.1875000	85.240	4,262.00	16827	1 LaSalle
30,627.780			4,234.930		\$1,445,233.03		3,527.510	\$1,077,093.89	22	